Solicitation No.: DACW64-01-B-0026 Date Issued: Date Opened: 7-3-01

Project Title: UTILITY INSTALLATION AT INDIVIDUAL SITES FOR TRAVEL TRAILERS

OFFEROR: ARETE REAL ESTATE & DEVELOPMENT

Business Size:

ITEM UNIT
NO. DESCRIPTION QUANTITY PRICE TOTAL
0001 JTEMPORARY BURIED ELECTRICAL SER] 1 EA 1275.00 1,275.00
0002 |BURIED WIRING BEYOND 50 FT. 1 LF 25.00 25.00
0003 JELEC. SERV - HOME TO TRAILER HOOK]| 1 EA 1023.00 1,023.00
0004 JwWALL MOUNTED WIRING BEYOND 50 F] 1 LF 17.00 17.00
0005 JWALL MOUNTED ELEC. SERVICE 1 EA 1134.00 1,134.00
0006 JUNDERGROUND ELEC. SERVICE 1 EA 1380.00 1,380.00
0007 JELEC. SERVICE TO WELL PUMP 1 EA 1638.00 1,638.00
0008 JWIRING OF WELL PUMP BEYOND 50 FT. 1 LF 20.00 20.00
0009 |POWER POLE & TRAILER HOOKUP POIN 1 EA 1974.00 1,974.00
0010 JPOWER COMPANY SERVICE FEE 1 LF NO BID REQUIRED
0011 ]JPOTABLE WATER SERVICE UNDERGRO| 1 EA 682.50 682.50
0012 3/4" WATER LINE, BEYOND 50 FT. 1 LF 13.25 13.25
0013 JEXCAV/CONNECT HOME SANITARY SEH 1 EA 525.00 525.00
0014 JEXCAV/CONNECT TO HOME SEPTIC TAN 1 EA 525.00 525.00
0015 [MUNICIPAL WATER TAP FEE 1 EA NO BID REQUIRED
0016  JPERMIT/INSPECTION FEE 1 EA NO BID REQUIRED
0017 JINSTALL UNDERGROUND SEWER LINE 1 LF 22.50 22.50
0018 ]JINSTALL MUNICIPAL SEWER TAP 1 EA 350.00 350.00
0019 JSEWER TAPFEE 1 EA NO BID REQUIRED

TOTAL SCHEDULE NO. 1 | 10,604.25




OFFEROR: CUSTOM ELECTRICAL SERVICES

Business Size:

ITEM UNIT
NO. DESCRIPTION QUANTITY PRICE TOTAL
0001 JTEMPORARY BURIED ELECTRICAL SER] 1 EA 1050.00 1,050.00
0002 |BURIED WIRING BEYOND 50 FT. 1 LF 5.50 5.50
0003 ]JELEC. SERV - HOME TO TRAILER HOOK]| 1 EA 1450.00 1,450.00
0004 JwALL MOUNTED WIRING BEYOND 50 F] 1 LF 4.50 4.50
0005 JWALL MOUNTED ELEC. SERVICE 1 EA 1100.00 1,100.00
0006 JUNDERGROUND ELEC. SERVICE 1 EA 5.50 5.50
0007 JELEC. SERVICE TO WELL PUMP 1 EA 900.00 900.00
0008 JWIRING OF WELL PUMP BEYOND 50 FT. 1 LF 4.50 4.50
0009 |POWER POLE & TRAILER HOOKUP POIN 1 EA 1650.00 1,650.00
0010 JPOWER COMPANY SERVICE FEE 1 LF NO BID REQUIRED
0011 ]JPOTABLE WATER SERVICE UNDERGRO| 1 EA 350.00 350.00
0012 3/4" WATER LINE, BEYOND 50 FT. 1 LF 1.75 1.75
0013 JEXCAV/CONNECT HOME SANITARY SEH 1 EA 850.00 850.00
0014 JEXCAV/CONNECT TO HOME SEPTIC TAN 1 EA 850.00 850.00
0015 [MUNICIPAL WATER TAP FEE 1 EA NO BID REQUIRED
0016  JPERMIT/INSPECTION FEE 1 EA NO BID REQUIRED
0017 JINSTALL UNDERGROUND SEWER LINE 1 LF 8.50 8.50
0018 JINSTALL MUNICIPAL SEWER TAP 1 EA 1500.00 1,500.00
0019 JSEWER TAPFEE 1 EA NO BID REQUIRED

TOTAL SCHEDULE NO. 1 | 9,730.25







Solicitation No.: DACW64-01-B-0026

Date Issued:

Date Opened: 7-3-01

Project Title: UTILITY INSTALLATION AT INDIVIDUAL SITES FOR TRAVEL TRAILERS

OFFEROR: SiteConGroup. Inc.

Business Size:

ITEM UNIT
NO. DESCRIPTION QUANTITY PRICE TOTAL
0001 JTEMPORARY BURIED ELECTRICAL SER] 1 EA 990.00 990.00
0002 |BURIED WIRING BEYOND 50 FT. 1 LF 8.00 8.00
0003 ]JELEC. SERV - HOME TO TRAILER HOOK]| 1 EA 740.00 740.00
0004 JwWALL MOUNTED WIRING BEYOND 50 F] 1 LF 4.00 4.00
0005 JWALL MOUNTED ELEC. SERVICE 1 EA 660.00 660.00
0006 JUNDERGROUND ELEC. SERVICE 1 EA 960.00 960.00
0007 JELEC. SERVICE TO WELL PUMP 1 EA 1080.00 1,080.00
0008 JWIRING OF WELL PUMP BEYOND 50 FT. 1 LF 8.00 8.00
0009 |POWER POLE & TRAILER HOOKUP POIN 1 EA 1960.00 1,960.00
0010 JPOWER COMPANY SERVICE FEE 1 LF NO BID REQUIRED
0011 ]JPOTABLE WATER SERVICE UNDERGRO| 1 EA 820.00 820.00
0012 3/4" WATER LINE, BEYOND 50 FT. 1 LF 8.00 8.00
0013 JEXCAV/CONNECT HOME SANITARY SEF 1 EA 940.00 940.00
0014 JEXCAV/CONNECT TO HOME SEPTIC TAN 1 EA 850.00 850.00
0015 [MUNICIPAL WATER TAP FEE 1 EA NO BID REQUIRED
0016  JPERMIT/INSPECTION FEE 1 EA NO BID REQUIRED
0017 JINSTALL UNDERGROUND SEWER LINE 1 LF 40.00 40.00
0018 JINSTALL MUNICIPAL SEWER TAP 1 EA 1040.00 1,040.00
0019 JSEWER TAPFEE 1 EA NO BID REQUIRED

TOTAL SCHEDULE NO. 1 | 10,108.00

ABSTRACT OF OFFERS

Solicitation No.: DACW64-01-B-0026

Date Issued:

Date Opened: 7-3-01

Issuing Office: USAED-Galveston

Project Title: INDEFINITE DELIVERY UTILITY INSTALLATION AT INDIVIDUAL SITES FOR TRAVEL TRAILEF

Number of Amendments Issued: 0001
GOVERNMENT ESTIMATE (Without Profit)

ITEM UNIT

NO. DESCRIPTION QUANTITY PRICE TOTAL
0001 JTEMPORARY BURIED ELECTRICAL SER] 1 EA 700.00 700.00
0002 |BURIED WIRING BEYOND 50 FT. 1 LF 9.00 9.00
0003 ]JELEC. SERV - HOME TO TRAILER HOOK]| 1 EA 550.00 550.00
0004 JwALL MOUNTED WIRING BEYOND 50 F] 1 LF 6.00 6.00
0005 JWALL MOUNTED ELEC. SERVICE 1 EA 490.00 490.00
0006 JUNDERGROUND ELEC. SERVICE 1 EA 700.00 700.00
0007 JELEC. SERVICE TO WELL PUMP 1 EA 1340.00 1,340.00
0008 JWIRING OF WELL PUMP BEYOND 50 FT. 1 LF 6.00 6.00
0009 |POWER POLE & TRAILER HOOKUP POIN 1 EA 1346.00 1,346.00
0010 JPOWER COMPANY SERVICE FEE 1 LF NO BID REQUIRED

0011 ]JPOTABLE WATER SERVICE UNDERGRO| 1 EA 570.00 570.00
0012 3/4" WATER LINE, BEYOND 50 FT. 1 LF 6.00 6.00
0013 JEXCAV/CONNECT HOME SANITARY SEF 1 EA 400.00 400.00
0014 JEXCAV/CONNECT TO HOME SEPTIC TAD 1 EA 400.00 400.00
0015 IMUNICIPAL WATER TAP FEE 1 EA NO BID REQUIRED

0016  JPERMIT/INSPECTION FEE 1 EA NO BID REQUIRED

0017 JINSTALL UNDERGROUND SEWER LINE 1 LF 8.00 8.00
0018 JINSTALL MUNICIPAL SEWER TAP 1 EA 1335.00 1,335.00
0019 JSEWER TAPFEE 1 EA NO BID REQUIRED




| TOTAL SCHEDULENO.1 | | 7,866.00 |

The apparent low bidder is % below the Government's Estimate

| CERTIFY THAT | HAVE OPENED, READ, AND RECORDED ON THISABSTRACT ALL OFFERS

LINDA M. FREDENDALL

CONTRACTING OFFICER



